Community Unit School District 300

Old deLacey School and Dundee-Crown High School
1 P.M. Wednesday, July 29, 2009

Mass Demolition - 02A
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Trade Contractor Base Bid QN Combination Bid Notes
AKA Wrecking Company LLC Withdrawn
Alpine Demolition Service $ 185,700.00 || N | x x | x
American Demolition Service $ 98,000.00 || x | x x | x
Break Thru Enterprises, Inc. $ 149,000.00 || x | x x | x
Champion Environmental Services No Bid
DEM/EX Group, Inc. $ 178,000.00 || x | x x | x
Dore & Associates Contractors $ 192,200.00 || x | x x | x
Environmental Cleansing Corp. $ 139,984.00 || x | x x | x
Johler Demolition $ 96,900.00 || x | x N[N
KLF Excavating Withdrawn
Langos Corporation $ 129,500.00 || x | x x | x
Martinez Frog's Inc. No Bid
Meridian Industrial Services $ 178,000.00 || N | x N|N
N F Demolition, Inc. $ 115,940.00 || x | x x | x
National Wrecking Company $ 167,300.00 || x | x x | x
Omega Demolition Company $ 133,000.00 || N | x N|N
Robinette Demolition, Inc. No Bid
Berger $ 181,000.00 || x | x x| N
Low Bid $ 98,000.00




Community Unit School District 300

Old deLacey School and Dundee-Crown High School

1 P.M. Wednesday, July 29, 2009

Excavation & Site Utilities - 02B
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Trade Contractor Base Bid Parking No Haul off of Spoils ¥RV Combination Bid Notes
Fox Excavating, Inc. Withdrawn
Kane County Excavating Withdrawn
MGT Trucking & Excavating Withdrawn
Martinez Frog's Inc. No Bid
River Valley Land Improvemts. No Bid
Midwest Grading $ 284,000.00 | $ 6,850.00 | $ (74,000.00)|| x | x x | x
Everest Excavating, Inc. $ 266,150.00 | $ 7,250.00 | $ (51,000.00)|| x | x x| x
J. S. Riemer, Inc. $ 262,234.00 | $ 9,500.00 | $ (42,000.00)|| x | x x| x
Sinnett Builders, Inc. $ 246,988.00 | $ 3,188.00 | $ (70,000.00)|| x | x x| x
J. Pease, Inc. $ 245,748.00 | $ 6,640.00 | $ (66,700.00)|| x | x x| x
[Berger Excavating Contractors | 240,800.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ (66,000.00)|| x | x x | x |02A and 02B $395000
Schneider Excavating $ 239,656.00 | $ 7,800.00 | $ (82,343.00)|| x | x x | x
Vegter Excavating, Inc. $ 228,538.82 | $ 4,000.00 | $ (31,000.00)| x | x x | x
Campton Excavating, Inc. $ 216,823.00 | $ 6,600.00 | $ (42,150.00)|| x | x x| x
Copenhaver $ 209,000.00 | $ 19,000.00 | $ (7,000.00)|| x | x x | x
Read Excavating $ 196,358.00 | $ 6,770.00 | $ (42,175.00)|| x | x x | x
Low Bid $ 196,358.00 | $ 6,770.00 | $ (42,175.00)




Community Unit School District 300

Old deLacey School and Dundee-Crown High School
1 P.M. Wednesday, July 29, 2009

Asphalt Paving - 02D
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Trade Contractor Base Bid Parking YOS Combination Bid Notes

Abbey Paving $ 73,583.00 | $ 17,320.00 || x | x x | x

Arrow Road Construction No Bid

Champion Paving Corporation $ 73,000.00 | $ 21,200.00 || x | x x | x

DeKalb Paving No Bid

Evans & Son Blacktop, Inc. $ 73,350.00 | $ 18,200.00 || x | x N[N

Glander Paving Company $ 79,000.00 | $ 21,000.00 || x | x x | x

Plote, Inc. No Bid

Schroeder Asphalt Service $ 84,270.00 | $ 18,900.00 || x | x x | x

Low Bid $ 73,583.00 | $ 17,320.00




Community Unit School District 300

Old deLacey School and Dundee-Crown High School
1 P.M. Wednesday, July 29, 2009

Landscaping - 02F
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Trade Contractor Base Bid Additional Parking Fence OGS R Combination Bid Notes

Alaniz Group No Bid

Breezy Hill Nursery No Bid

Cooling Landscape Contractors $ 41,700.00 | $ 1,270.00 | $ 11,908.00 || x | x x | x

Copenhaver, Inc. $ 38,500.00 | $ 1,900.00 | $ 1,300.00 || x | x x | x

Del Toro Landscaping, Inc. $ 31,180.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 15,275.00 || x | x x | x

Frank's Creative Landscaping No Bid

Sebert Landscaping $ 32,170.00 | $ 709.00 | $ 4,830.00 || x | x x | x

Low Bid $ 32,170.00 [ $ 709.00 [ $ 4,830.00




Community Unit School District 300

Old deLacey School and Dundee-Crown High School

1 P.M. Wednesday, July 29, 2009
Fencing - 02G
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Trade Contractor Base Bid v Q:o 1678\ Q° Combination Bid Notes
Action Fence $ 19,520.00 || x | x N[ x
Fence Connection, Inc. $ 17,991.00 || x | x x | x
Fox Valley Fence $ 17,287.00 || x | x x | x
GFS Fence, Guardrail, & Sign $ 32,275.00 || x | x X | x
Peerless Fence $ 17,998.00 || x | x N[ x
Low Bid $ 17,287.00




Community Unit School District 300

Old deLacey School and Dundee-Crown High School
1 P.M. Wednesday, July 29, 2009

Electrical - 16A
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Trade Contractor Base Bid v" Y Combination Bid Notes
Adlite Electric Co. Inc. $ 57,585.00 || x | x N | x
Associated Electrical Contractors, Inc. $ 49,700.00 || x | x x | x
Carey Electric Contracting $ 53,584.00 || x | x x | x
Kellenberger Electric $ 54,700.00 || x | x x | x
Kll Electrical Contractors $ 53,314.00 || x | x x | x
Ridgeview Electric No Bid
Utility Dynamics Corporation $ 68,300.00 || x | x x | x

Low Bid $ 49,700.00






