
Batavia School District 101
Batavia High School Addition/Renovations - Phase 2

 Excavation - 02B-1

2:00 P.M. Wednesday March 25, 2009

Trade Contractor Base Bid Alternate A-13 A
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Combination Bid Notes

Berger Excavating 840,000.00$       201,500.00$       x x x x  

Builders Concrete Company No Bid

Campton Excavating 645,800.00$       180,000.00$       x x x x

Diamond Unlimited, Inc. No Bid

DuPage Topsoil Inc. 1,076,789.00$    280,280.00$       x x x x

Fox Excavating, Inc. 656,500.00$       200,000.00$       x x x x

J.S. Riemer, Inc. 860,000.00$       130,000.00$       x x x x

Morris Excavating, Inc. No Bid

Plaza Excavating No Bid

R.A. Abbott Excavating, Inc. 730,000.00$       4 x x x

Read Excavating 620,000.00$       88,357.00$         x x x x

Riemer Engineering Withdrawn

Schneider Excavating 693,120.00$       119,000.00$       x x x x

Sinnett Builders, Inc. 768,000.00$       123,000.00$       x x x x

Stokes Excavating No Bid

 

Low Bid 620,000.00$       88,357.00$         



Batavia School District 101
Batavia High School Addition/Renovations - Phase 2

Asphalt Paving - 02D-1

2:00 P.M. Wednesday March 25, 2009

Trade Contractor Base Bid A
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Combination Bid Notes

A Lamp Concrete No Bid

Abbey Paving Co., Inc. 375,420.00$        x x x x 02D & 02E $680,625.00

Champion Paving Corp. 365,000.00$        x x x x

Chicagoland Paving No Bid

Construction Management Withdrawn

DeKalb Paving 365,600.00$        x x x x

Geneva Construction 455,000.00$        x x x x

Hardin Paving Co. 431,862.00$        x x x x

Maul Paving No Bid

Orange Crush LLC 427,880.00$        x x x

Schroeder Asphalt No Bid

Low Bid 365,000.00$        



Batavia School District 101
Batavia High School Addition/Renovations - Phase 2

2:00 P.M. Wednesday March 25, 2009

Site Concrete - 02E-1
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Combination Bid Notes

A Lamp Concrete No Bid

Abby Paving 310,205.00$       x x x x 02D & 02E $680,625

Alliance Contractors, Inc. 378,915.00$       x x x x

Boller Construction No Bid

Builders Concrete Co. No Bid

Chadwick Contracting Co. 297,190.00$       x x x x

Commercial Contracting 286,000.00$       x x x x 03A&02E $2,310,000

Driessen Construction 435,000.00$       x x x x

Eagle Concrete Inc. No Bid

Geneva Construction Co. 334,000.00$       x x x

J. Pease, Inc. 380,150.00$       x x x x

Landmark Contractors 374,125.00$       x x x x

Scurto Cement Const. 341,380.00$       x x x x 03A&02E $2,456,380

Tricon 288,627.00$       x x x x

Low Bid 286,000.00$       



Batavia School District 101
Batavia High School Addition/Renovations - Phase 2

Landscaping - 02F-1

2:00 P.M. Wednesday March 25, 2009

Trade Contractor Base Bid Alternate A-5 Alternate A-13 A
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Combination Bid Notes

M. Goodman Landscape No Bid

O'Donovan's & Son, Inc. 160,066.00$       46,196.00$         200,226.00$       x x x x

Pedersen Landscaping No Bid

Sebert Landscaping 112,885.00$       47,955.00$         182,577.00$       x x x x

Suburban Lawn Withdrawn

The T.L.C. Group Inc. 119,405.36$       30,050.45$         194,955.17$       x x x x

Twin Oaks Landscaping No Bid

Walsh Landscape Const. 173,485.00$       55,543.00$         240,777.00$       x x x x

Low Bid 112,885.00$       



 Building Concrete - 03A-1

Batavia School District 101
Batavia High School Addition/Renovations - Phase 2

2:00 P.M. Wednesday March 25, 2009

Trade Contractor Base Bid Alternate A-16 A
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Combination Bid Notes

Alliance Contractors, Inc. No Bid

Boller Construction 2,191,000.00$    10,000.00$         x x x x

Builders Concrete Company 1,649,000.00$    22,650.00$         x x x x

Commercial Contracting Corp. 2,029,000.00$    26,000.00$         x x x x 03A&13A $3,860,000

Eagle Concrete Inc. Withdrawn

Elliott Construction Corporation 1,963,100.00$    34,870.00$         x x x x

Lamberti Concrete Co., Inc. No Bid

M/M Peters Construction 2,235,000.00$    10,000.00$         x x x x

Manusos General Contracting 1,548,000.00$    x x x x

Martin Cement Company 1,827,750.00$    6,555.00$           x x x x

R&W Clark Construction No Bid

Scurto Cement 2,136,800.00$    8,400.00$           x x x x 02E&03A $2,456,380

Tor Construction (Parkway) 1,809,000.00$    5,000.00$           x x x x

Tricon Concrete Contractors, Inc. 1,680,472.00$    18,210.00$         x x x x

Vacala Construction, Inc. No Bid

Low Bid 1,548,000.00$    6,555.00$           



Batavia School District 101
Batavia High School Addition/Renovations - Phase 2

2:00 P.M. Wednesday March 25, 2009

Pre-Cast Concrete Wall Panels 03C-1

Trade Contractor Base Bid Alternate A-8 A
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Combination Bid Notes

ATMI Precast 1,239,325.00$    x x x No Bid Deposit

Dukane Precast, Inc. 979,120.00$       5,000.00$           x x x x

J.W. Peters, Inc. 1,460,432.00$    3,340.00$           x x x x

Mid-States Concrete Products 998,998.00$       5,588.00$           x x x x

Spancrete of Illinois, Inc. No Bid

Stress-Con Industries, Inc. 1,455,000.00$    6,000.00$           x x x x

Low Bid 979,120.00$       5,000.00$           



Masonry - 04A-1

Batavia School District 101
Batavia High School Addition/Renovations - Phase 2

2:00 P.M. Wednesday March 25, 2009

Trade Contractor Base Bid A
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Combination Bid Notes

Driessen Construction 2,324,000.00$    x x x x

G. Porter & Co. 2,339,000.00$    x x x x

GC Masonry No Bid

J&E Duff Inc. 2,648,500.00$    x x x x

Jimmy'Z Masonry 2,287,400.00$    x x x x

Masonry Corp. 2,412,000.00$    x x x x

Mastership Construction 2,444,000.00$    x x x x

Midwest Masonry 2,767,000.00$    x x x x

Mike Cachey Construction No Bid

MPZ Masonry 2,360,000.00$    x x x

Pyzik Masonry 2,700,000.00$    x x x x

 

Low Bid 2,287,400.00$    



Batavia School District 101
Batavia High School Addition/Renovations - Phase 2

2:00 P.M. Wednesday March 25, 2009

Structural Steel - 05A-1

Trade Contractor Base Bid Alternate A-15 Alternate A-16 A
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Combination Bid Notes

Carlo Steel No Bid

Construction Systems, Inc. No Bid

Lenex Steel Company 1,906,119.00$    -$                    6,093.00$           x x x x

McKinney Steel & Sales 1,802,300.00$    -$                    1,200.00$           x x x x  

S. G. Krauss 2,149,900.00$    550.00$              5,500.00$           x x x x

Shelco Steel Work 2,306,951.00$    -$                    5,300.00$           x x x x

Steel Sales & Service, Inc. Withdrawn

T.A. Bowman 1,928,733.00$    -$                    1,350.00$           x x x x 05A&13A $2,930,000

Wm.  Horn Structural Steel No Bid x x x x

Waukegan Steel 1,931,561.00$    -$                    1,000.00$           

Low Bid 1,802,300.00$    -$                    1,200.00$           



General Trades - 06A-1 

Batavia School District 101
Batavia High School Addition/Renovations - Phase 2

2:00 P.M. Wednesday March 25, 2009

Trade Contractor Base Bid Alternate A-6 Alternate A-11 Alternate A-15 Alternate A-16 A
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Combination Bid Notes

Boller Construction 2,278,000.00$    (19,000.00)$       73,500.00$         18,000.00$         55,000.00$         x x x x

Cosgrove Construction, Inc. 2,450,000.00$    (5,200.00)$         66,000.00$         22,000.00$         44,000.00$         x x

Doherty Construction 2,184,000.00$    (6,600.00)$         57,300.00$         17,500.00$         41,500.00$         x x x x 06A& 09A $2,509,000

Edwin Anderson Construction 2,088,000.00$    (6,700.00)$         58,000.00$         22,900.00$         44,400.00$         x x

Hargrave Builders 1,972,000.00$    (6,800.00)$         54,000.00$         15,920.00$         37,000.00$         x x x x  

J.C. Harris & Sons 2,035,990.00$    (21,250.00)$       72,534.00$         12,850.00$         32,743.00$         x x x x

L.J. Morse Withdrawn

Manusos General Contracting 2,559,000.00$    (19,000.00)$       -$                   6,500.00$           4,500.00$           x x x x

R. L. Sohol No Bid

RB Construction, Inc. 2,029,400.00$    11,500.00$         39,750.00$         x x x x

Shales McNutt Construction 2,158,166.00$    (6,600.00)$         60,691.00$         10,058.00$         28,336.00$         x x x x

Tor Construction (Parkway) No Bid

Low Bid 1,972,000.00$    (6,800.00)$         54,000.00$         15,920.00$         37,000.00$         



Batavia School District 101
Batavia High School Addition/Renovations - Phase 2

2:00 P.M. Wednesday March 25, 2009

Roofing - 07A-1
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Combination Bid Notes

A-1 Roofing 717,500.00$       x x x x

Anthony Roofing 898,680.00$       x x x x

Elens & Maichin Roofing 650,600.00$       x x x x

Malcor Roofing No Bid

Olsson Roofing Co. 645,240.00$       x x x x

R.E. Burke Roofing 730,000.00$       x x x x

Riddiford Roofing 866,600.00$       x x x x

Robinson Roofing No Bid

Singles Roofing, Inc. No Bid

Sullivan Roofing, Inc. 653,000.00$       x x x

Weatherguard Roofing 718,000.00$       x x x x

Low Bid 645,240.00$       



Batavia School District 101
Batavia High School Addition/Renovations - Phase 2

2:00 P.M. Wednesday March 25, 2009

Spray on Fireproofing - 07C-1
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Combination Bid Notes

Barrier Corporation No Bid

IFE & S, Inc. No Bid

Kremer Davis Inc. No Bid

Midwest Service Group 141,200.00$       x x x x

Spray Insulations, Inc. 207,000.00$       x x x x

Streich Corporation No Bid

Low Bid 141,200.00$       



Aluminum, Glass, and Glazing - 08B-1

Batavia School District 101
Batavia High School Addition/Renovations - Phase 2

2:00 P.M. Wednesday March 25, 2009

Trade Contractor Base Bid Alternate A-6 Alternate A-8 Alternate A-16 A
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Combination Bid Notes

3F Corporation 257,890.00$       60,200.00$         173,200.00$       5,200.00$           x x x x

Cardinal Glass Withdrawn

Krull Window Company 237,738.00$       53,664.00$         188,573.00$       3,547.00$           x x x x

Lake Shore Glass & Mirror Co. 276,995.00$       55,680.00$         183,900.00$       3,652.00$           x x x x

McHenry County Glass & Mirror 310,400.00$       54,500.00$         172,400.00$       2,450.00$           x x x x

Prime Architectural Metal & Glass, Inc. 394,000.00$       72,000.00$         252,000.00$       10,500.00$         No Bid Security

Quint G, Inc. No Bid

Replacement Window Systems 264,760.00$       53,280.00$         175,187.00$       3,098.00$           x x x x

Triumph Restoration, Inc. No Bid

Low Bid 237,738.00$       53,664.00$         188,573.00$       3,547.00$           



Batavia School District 101
Batavia High School Addition/Renovations - Phase 2

2:00 P.M. Wednesday March 25, 2009

Drywall - 09A-1
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Combination Bid Notes

Airtite Contractors, Inc. No Bid

Chakra, Inc 275,677.00$       x x x x

Doherty Construction 338,400.00$       x x x x 06A&09A  $2,509,000

Drywall Service Inc. No Bid

International Decorators, Inc. Withdrawn

Levy Company 1,125,000.00$    x x x x

L.J. Morse Const. Company 195,070.00$       x x x x

The Rockwell Group 288,100.00$       3 x x x

Low Bid 195,070.00$       



Batavia School District 101
Batavia High School Addition/Renovations - Phase 2

2:00 P.M. Wednesday March 25, 2009

Ceramic Tile - 09B-1

Trade Contractor Base Bid Alternate A-2 A
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Combination Bid Notes

Dave's Tile (DTI of Illinois) 45,550.00$         301,000.00$       x x x x

Douglas Carpet One 41,443.00$         327,000.00$       x x x x

Libertyville Tile & Carpet No Bid

Midwest Floor Covering, Inc. No Bid

Northern Illinois Terrazzo 38,100.00$         207,800.00$       x x x x

Rockford Central Tile & Terrazzo No Bid

Trostrud Mosaic & Tile Co., Inc. Withdrawn

Low Bid 38,100.00$         207,800.00$       



Acoustic Ceiling - 09D-1

Batavia School District 101
Batavia High School Addition/Renovations - Phase 2

2:00 P.M. Wednesday March 25, 2009
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Combination Bid Notes

Airtite Contractors, Inc. 372,500.00$       x x x x

Drywall Service, Inc. No Bid

International Decorators, Inc. Withdrawn

Just Rite Acoustics, Inc. 350,800.00$       x x x x

Midwest Acoustics 327,364.00$       x x x x

The Rockwell Group No Bid

Low Bid 327,364.00$       



Batavia School District 101
Batavia High School Addition/Renovations - Phase 2

2:00 P.M. Wednesday March 25, 2009

Athletic Flooring 9E-1
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Combination Bid Notes

Beynon Sports Surfaces No Bid

Dynamic Sports Construction 505,000.00$       x x x x

Floor Logic No Bid

Floors Incorporated 575,800.00$       x x x x

Haldeman Homme 661,000.00$       x x x x

Kiefer Specialty Flooring, Inc. No Bid x x x x

Manico Flooring, Inc. Withdrawn

Low Bid 505,000.00$       



Batavia School District 101
Batavia High School Addition/Renovations - Phase 2

Carpet & Resilient Flooring - 09F-1

2:00 P.M. Wednesday March 25, 2009

Trade Contractor Base Bid Alternate A-4 Alternate A-15 A
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Combination Bid Notes

Johnson Flooring 153,700.00$       4,200.00$           1,590.00$           x x x x

Kingston Tile Company, Inc. Withdrawn

Libertyville Tile & Carpet 149,000.00$       10,360.00$         2,897.00$           x x x x

Manico Flooring, Inc. Withdrawn

Midwest Floor Covering, Inc. No Bid

Rockford Carpetland USA, Inc. 134,889.00$       3,238.00$           3,450.00$           4 x x x

Vortex Enterprises, Inc. 118,286.00$       11,498.00$         3,211.00$           x x

Low Bid 118,286.00$       11,498.00$         3,211.00$           



Painting - 09G-1

Batavia School District 101
Batavia High School Addition/Renovations - Phase 2

2:00 P.M. Wednesday March 25, 2009

Trade Contractor Base Bid Alternate A-2 Alternate A-4 Alternate A-8 Alternate A-15 Alternate A-16 A
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Combination Bid Notes

Able Painting No Bid

Bowne Painting No Bid

Brookdale Decorating Withdrawn

D.E.S. Painting, Inc. 298,814.00$       (13,000.00)$        (1,700.00)$          6,000.00$           1,110.00$           1,000.00$           x x x No Bid Security

Drywall Service, Inc. 239,360.00$       (9,500.00)$          (975.00)$             14,780.00$         2,500.00$           4,500.00$           x x x x

International Decorators Withdrawn

J&M Decorating, Inc. Withdrawn

Louis Painting No Bid

Nedrow Decorating, Inc. No Bid

Nickolas Painting 381,000.00$       12,500.00$         1,800.00$           1,950.00$           x x x x

Oosterbaan & Sons Co. 353,800.00$       (13,500.00)$        (2,000.00)$          3,800.00$           1,500.00$           1,800.00$           x x x x

Ruffalo Painting 269,777.00$       (5,356.00)$          (1,994.00)$          4,650.00$           1,805.00$           862.00$              x x x x

Soustos Decorating Co. 310,150.00$       (13,150.00)$        (2,300.00)$          2,500.00$           2,750.00$           1,200.00$           x x x x

Low Bid 239,360.00$       (9,500.00)$          (975.00)$             14,780.00$         2,500.00$           4,500.00$           



Batavia School District 101
Batavia High School Addition/Renovations - Phase 2

Athletic Equipment - 11A-1

2:00 P.M. Wednesday March 25, 2009
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Combination Bid Notes

Carroll Seating Company 305,297.00$       (15,000.00)$        18,529.00$         y y y y

H & B, Inc. 286,600.00$       (23,800.00)$        18,300.00$         y y y

Haldeman-Homme, Inc. 338,550.00$       (10,000.00)$        37,800.00$         y y y y

Hufcor Chicago, Inc. 268,500.00$       (30,115.00)$        17,640.00$         y y y y

Larson Equipment Co. No Bid

Reil Construction, Inc. No Bid

Low Bid 268,500.00$       (30,115.00)$        17,640.00$         



Batavia School District 101
Batavia High School Addition/Renovations - Phase 2

Stage Curtain & Rigging/Orchestra Shell - 12D-1

2:00 P.M. Wednesday March 25, 2009

Trade Contractor Base Bid Alternate A-1 Alternate A-12 A
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Combination Bid Notes

CM Buck & Associates 559,500.00$       (52,650.00)$        (25,450.00)$        y y y y

Grand Stage Light Studio 558,500.00$       (72,600.00)$        (25,000.00)$        y y y y

Secoa 505,669.00$       (98,000.00)$        (38,335.00)$        y y y y

Associated Controls No Bid

Low Bid 505,669.00$       (98,000.00)$        (38,335.00)$        



Batavia School District 101
Batavia High School Addition/Renovations - Phase 2

Pre-Engineered Building System - 13A-1

2:00 P.M. Wednesday March 25, 2009
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Combination Bid Notes

Altra Builders, Inc. No Bid

Area Erectors 1,080,000.00$    141,600.00$       45,000.00$         y y y y

Behlen Building Systems No Bid

Commercial Cont. Corp. 1,857,000.00$    396,000.00$       251,000.00$       y y y 4,137,000.00$               02E/03A

Cord Construction Co. 1,397,481.00$    168,859.00$       38,662.00$         y y y y

CW Construction Services 1,311,100.00$    182,745.00$       55,885.00$         y y y y

Inland Buildings No Bid

Tri-State Enterprises, Inc. 1,362,786.00$    295,000.00$       95,000.00$         y y y

TA Bowman 1,022,400.00$    134,400.00$       59,900.00$         y y y y 2,930,000.00$               05A

Low Bid 1,022,400.00$    134,400.00$       59,900.00$         



Plumbing - 15A-1

Batavia School District 101
Batavia High School Addition/Renovations - Phase 2

2:00 P.M. Wednesday March 25, 2009

Trade Contractor Base Bid Alternate A-15 A
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Combination Bid Notes

Capitol Mechanical 567,890.00$       3,510.00$           y y y y

C. R. Leonard 608,694.00$       8,500.00$           y y y y

DeFranco Plumbing 648,900.00$       6,525.00$           y y y

Hartwig Plumbing 629,800.00$       4,367.00$           y y y y

Hogan's Plumbing 715,165.00$       8,390.00$           y y y

MG Mechanical, Inc. 620,000.00$       4,870.00$           y y y y

R. J. Kuhn, Inc. 612,164.00$       6,707.00$           y y y y

Shearman Mechanical 612,000.00$       5,900.00$           y y y y

Unique Plumbing No Bid

Mech Inc. 655,000.00$       7,230.00$           y y y y

Mechanical Concepts No Bid

 

Low Bid 567,890.00$       3,510.00$           



Batavia School District 101
Batavia High School Addition/Renovations - Phase 2

Fire Protection - 15B-1

2:00 P.M. Wednesday March 25, 2009
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Combination Bid Notes

Alliance Fire Protection, Inc. 297,600.00$       (1,000.00)$          y y y y

Automatic Fire Systems, Inc. 401,940.00$       (13,000.00)$        y y y y Alt 8-ADD2750

C. L. Doucette, Inc. 399,200.00$       (6,000.00)$          y y y y

Nelson Fire Protection 401,247.00$       12,576.00$         y y

Optimal Fire Protection 394,000.00$       (13,382.00)$        y y y

Ryan Fire Protection, Inc. 420,838.00$       (17,952.00)$        y y y y

S.J. Carlson Fire Protection 414,985.00$       (6,500.00)$          y y y y

Sentinel Fire Protection 454,610.00$       (39,835.00)$        y y y y Alt8 Add 14240

Valley Fire Protection Systems 235,000.00$       (6,000.00)$          y y y y

Wolverine Fire Protection 300,000.00$       y y

Low Bid 235,000.00$       (6,000.00)$          



HVAC - 15C-1 

Batavia School District 101
Batavia High School Addition/Renovations - Phase 2

2:00 P.M. Wednesday March 25, 2009
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Combination Bid Notes

Acitelli Heating & Piping 2,440,000.00$    64,000.00$         2,600.00$           y y y y

Amber Mechanical 2,368,000.00$    127,000.00$       2,300.00$           y y y y

DeKalb Mechanical No Bid

Flo-Tech Mechanical Systems 2,598,000.00$    80,000.00$         2,800.00$           y y y y

International Piping Systems 2,665,000.00$    (90,000.00)$        4,000.00$           y y y y

Mechanical Incorporated No Bid

MG Mechanical, Inc. 2,226,000.00$    58,000.00$         2,500.00$           y y y y 2,830,000.00$               15A/

Monaco Mechanical, Inc. 2,696,000.00$    63,000.00$         2,300.00$           y y y y

Premier Mechanical, Inc. 2,542,000.00$    y y y y

Mechanical Concepts 2,370,000.00$    96,700.00$         5,718.00$           y y y

Low Bid 2,226,000.00$    58,000.00$         2,500.00$           



Batavia School District 101

2:00 P.M. Wednesday March 25, 2009

Electrical - 16A-1 

Batavia High School Addition/Renovations - Phase 2
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Combination Bid Notes

Associated Electrical 2,429,500.00$           10,840.00$         41,000.00$         9,200.00$           15,550.00$         6,400.00$           y y y y

Carey Electric Contracting 2,754,000.00$           (7,600.00)$          8,600.00$           (9,100.00)$          20,700.00$         -$                    y y y y

Connelly Electric No Bid

D.L. Cook Corporation 2,319,700.00$           (1,000.00)$          15,600.00$         (6,000.00)$          17,000.00$         1,500.00$           y y y y

DiVane Brothers Electric 3,417,000.00$           (11,500.00)$        11,500.00$         (30,000.00)$        46,000.00$         29,500.00$         y y y y

Fitzgerald Electrical 2,054,300.00$           (3,200.00)$          5,150.00$           (1,400.00)$          16,800.00$         1,500.00$           y y y y

Mascal Electric 2,540,540.00$           (14,300.00)$        6,950.00$           (7,000.00)$          19,900.00$         1,500.00$           y y y y

Low Bid 2,054,300.00$           (3,200.00)$          5,150.00$           (1,400.00)$          16,800.00$         1,500.00$           



Batavia School District 101
Batavia High School Addition/Renovations - Phase 2

Technology - 16D-1

2:00 P.M. Wednesday March 25, 2009
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Combination Bid Notes

ABR Communications Withdrawn

Advanced Wiring Solutions Withdrawn

Applied Communications 71,251.00$         1,500.00$           y y y y

Complete Cabling Solutions 86,608.00$         3,553.00$           y y y

Gibson Electric & Technology No Bid

Huen Electric Withdrawn

Illinois Time Recorder No Bid

Malko Electric Company 130,388.42$       1,500.00$           y y y

Pentegra Systems No Bid

TelePlus, Inc. 75,960.00$         y y y y

Kelso Burnett 207,650.00$       15,000.00$         y y y y

Low Bid 71,251.00$         1,500.00$           



Batavia School District 101
Batavia High School Addition/Renovations - Phase 2

2:00 P.M. Wednesday March 25, 2009

Audio & Visual Equipment - 16F-1
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Combination Bid Notes

Berler Communications Withdrawn

Malko Electric Co. No Bid

Pentegra Systems 406,000.00$       y y y

Sound Vision, Inc. 405,744.19$       y y y

Tri-Electronics 431,078.00$       y y y

Roscor Corp 337,072.88$       y y y y

Low Bid 337,072.88$       



2:00 P.M. Wednesday March 25, 2009

Batavia School District 101
Batavia High School Addition/Renovations - Phase 2

Test and Balance - 17B-1
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Combination Bid Notes

Aaron Engineering 16,000.00$         y y y y

Controlled Test & Balance 48,500.00$         y y y y

International Test & Balance 16,900.00$         y y y y

Mechanical Test & Balance 18,625.00$         y y y y

Noble Air Test & Balance 31,535.00$         y y y y

Low Bid 16,000.00$         


