Elgin Community College Health Career Center for Excellence

Sitework Package
Friday, February 12, 2010

11:00 AM

Mass Grading 02A-1
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to onsite CY to onsite Y & .\\Q 0\\" &
Trade Contractor Location Base Bid location location vp VAT EIEN \05" Combination Bid Notes

Bell Land Improvement Elgin, IL $1,017,000.00 ($76,000.00) ($47,500.00)[| vy y y y y
Bisping Construction, Inc. New Lenox, IL  |no bid
Campton Excavating/Horton Farm [Elburn, IL no bid
DuPage Topsoil, Inc. West Chicago, IL| $1,235,100.00 ($48,000.00)|  ($30,000.00)([ y | vy y|lyly $1,300,000.00 |02a and 02b
Everest Excavating Gilberts, IL $1,175,000.00 ($60,000.00) ($37,500.00)[| vy y y y y $1,575,000.00 (02a and 02c
John Keno Co. Chicago, IL Withdrawn
Marc Kresmery Construction Elgin, IL no bid
Naperville Excavating Naperville, IL no bid
Pease Construction McHenry, IL $880,174.00 ($55,200.00) ($34,500.00)[| vy y y y y |no
RA Abbott Excavating Elgin, IL $1,225,000.00 ($80,000.00) ($50,000.00)|| vy y y y y $1,350,000.00 (02a and 02b
Read Excavating Gilberts, IL $780,504.00 ($75,200.00) ($47,000.00)|| vy y y y y |no
Riemer Engineering St. Charles, IL  |no bid
Ryan Inc janesville, wi $1,453,944.00 ($90,400.00) ($56,500.00)[| vy y y y y $1,775,726.00 [02a and 02b
Schneider Excavating Elgin, IL $1,123,395.00 ($112,000.00) ($70,000.00)[| vy y y y y |no
Vegter Excavating, Inc. Addison, IL $1,377,400.00 ($80,000.00) ($50,000.00)|| vy y y y y $1,618,900.00 (02a and 02b
js riemer $1,115,000.00 ($112,000.00) ($70,000.00)[| vy y y y y |no
Low Bid $780,504.00 ($75,200.00) ($47,000.00)




Elgin Community College Health Career Center for Excellence
Building and Landscape Package

Friday, February 12, 2010

Building Excavation 02B-1

Trade Contractor Location Base Bid Combination Bid Notes
B & B Permanent Seeding, Inc. Mundelein, IL no bid
Campton Excavating Elburn, IL $215,000.00 y y y $601,300.00 [02b and 02c
DuPage Topsoaoil, Inc. West Chicago, IL| $184,000.00 4 y y $1,300,000.00 |[02a and 02b
Hoppy's Landscaping Lockport, IL no bid
J.S. Riemer Elgin, IL $282,000.00 y y y y
Midwest Grading Geneva, IL $347,000.00 y y y y
Pease Construction McHenry, IL $141,948.37 y y y y
R. A. Abbott Excavating, Inc. Elgin, IL $205,000.00 y y y y
Read Excavating Gilberts, IL $190,077.00 y y y y
Riemer Engineering & Land St. Charles, IL  [no bid
Ryan Inc. Janesville, wi $361,783.00 y y y y |yes
Schneider Excavating Elgin, IL $185,072.00 y y y y
Vegter Excavating, Inc. Addison, IL $261,500.00 yes

Low Bid

$141,948.37
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Site Utilities 02C-1
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Trade Contractor Location Base Bid ?9 LS SR \06 Combination Bid Notes

Barone Contracting Elgin, IL $367,190.00 y y y y y
Campton Excavating/Horton Farm  |Elburn, IL $393,800.00 y y y y y |yes 02b and 02c
Concept Plumbing Palatine, IL $412,832.00 y y y y y
DiMeo Brothers Elk Grove Village, IL |no bid
DuPage Topsail, Inc. West Chicago, IL| $411,411.00 0 y y y y
Everest Excavating Gilberts, IL $419,900.00 y y y y
Fiordorosa Construction Elgin, IL $435,000.00 y y y y y
John Keno Chicago, IL Withdrawn
Marc Kresmery Elgin, IL $486,000.00 4 y y y y
Pease Construction McHenry, IL $352,081.33 y y y y y
River Valley Land Improvement Elgin, IL $353,948.00 y y y y y
Low Bid $352,081.33
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Asphalt Paving 02D-1
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Trade Contractor Location Base Bid NP WASWASYE VA Combination Bid Notes
A Lamp Concrete Schaumburg, IL [no bid
Abbey Paving Company Aurora, IL $48,535.00 y y y y y $224,500.00 |02d and 02e
Arrow Road Construction Co. Mount Prospect, IL $64,730.00 y y y y y
Curran Contracting Co. Crystal Lake, IL [no bid
Geneva Construction Co. Aurora, IL no bid
Hardin Paving Co. Wheeling, IL $60,330.00 y y y y
Schroeder Asphalt Service Marengo, IL $110,100.00 y y y y y
Accu-Paving Broadview, IL $74,135.00 y y y y y
Glander Paving Palatine, IL $59,000.00 y y y y y
Low Bid $48,535.00
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Site Concrete 02E-1
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Trade Contractor Location Base Bid vé Q;o &/ Q° \i‘% Combination Bid Notes

A Lamp Concrete Schaumburg, IL $189,545.00 y y y y y
Abbey Paving Co. Aurora, IL $181,965.00 y y y y y |yes
Alliance Contractors Inc. Woodstock, IL $238,905.00 y y y y y
Alright Concrete Streamwood, IL $424,475.00 y y y y y
Boller Construction Waukegan, IL $312,000.00 y y y y y
Builders Concrete Company Naperville, IL $191,495.00 y y y y
Chadwick Contracting Co. LITH, IL $212,972.00 y y y y y
Copenhaver Gilberts, IL $299,000.00 y y y y y
Eagle Concrete Inc. Batavia, IL no bid
Geneva Construction Co. Aurora, IL no bid
K. Keup Concrete Company Batavia, IL $209,650.00 y y y y y
Landmark Contracting Huntley, IL $183,501.00 y y y y y
M/M Peters Construction Aurora, IL $313,164.00 y y y y y
Tricon Concrete Contractors Minooka, IL $315,351.00 y y y y y
Pease Construction Woodstock, IL $212,825.00 y |y ylyl|ly
Low Bid $181,965.00
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Landscaping 02F-1
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Trade Contractor Location Base Bid SR Combination Bid Notes
Autumn Landscaping Schaumburg, IL  [No bid
B&B Permanent Seeding Mundelein, IL No bid
Breezy Hill Nursery Salem, WI $218,400.00 y y y y y
Clauss Bros. Inc. Streamwood, IL $280,500.00 y y y y y
Copenhaver Inc. Gilberts, IL $223,335.00 y y y y y
Countryside Industries Wauconda, IL $260,087.00 y y y y
Frank's Creative Landscaping Streamwood, IL  [No bid
Hayden Landscape Contractors Wauconda, IL $252,000.00 y y y y y
Hoppy's Landscaping Lockport, IL No bid
Moore Landscapes, Inc. Northbrook, IL Withdrawn
O'Donovan's & Son, Inc. Naperville, IL No bid
Pedersen Landscaping Co. St. Charles, IL $272,785.00 y y y y y
Sebert Landscaping, Inc. Bartlett, IL $260,000.00 y y y y y
Twin Oaks Landscaping Oswego, IL $237,842.81 3 y y y y
Low Bid $218,400.00
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Building Concrete 03A-1
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Trade Contractor Location Base Bid Shell vb LIV EES Combination Bid Notes
Alright Concrete Streamwood, IL | $1,041,225.00 $1,500.00 y y y y y
Baumgartner Construction Naperville, IL no bid
Boller Construction Waukegan, IL $999,000.00 $3,000.00 y y y y y
Builder's Concrete Services LLC Naperville, IL $1,086,840.00 $4,200.00 y y y y y
Eagle Concrete Inc. Batavia, IL $1,090,100.00 $4,500.00 y y y % y
K. Keup Concrete Construction Batavia, IL $1,264,499.00 $3,700.00 y y y y y
Lamberti Concrete Gilberts, IL no bid
M/M Peters Aurora, IL $1,325,583.00 $3,500.00 y y y y y
Martin Cement Co. Romeoville, IL $1,135,000.00 $1,800.00 y y y % y
Northwest Contractors Hampshire, IL $1,257,388.00 |n/a y y y y y
T. Manning Concrete, Inc. Huntley, IL $1,098,400.00 $7,260.00 y y y y y
Tor Construction Co. South Elgin, IL | $1,102,000.00 $1,900.00 y y y y y
Tricon Concrete Contractors Minooka, IL $1,029,643.00 |no bid y y y y y
Low Bid $999,000.00 $3,000.00




Elgin Community College Health Career Center for Excellence

Building and Landscape Package

Friday, February 12, 2010
11:00 AM

Masonry 04A-1
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Trade Contractor Location Base Bid Shell YLV Combination Bid Notes
Esche & Less, Inc. Arlington Heights, Il [no bid y y y y y
G. Porter & Company St. Charles, IL | $2,297,000.00 | $123,000.00
lllinois Masonry Corporation Lake Zurich, IL | $1,445,000.00 | $70,000.00 y y y y y
J. & E. Duff, Inc. West Chicago, IL | $1,483,000.00 | $74,900.00 y y y y y
J.A.C. Masonry, Inc. Lake Villa, IL $1,726,000.00 | $57,100.00 y y y y y
Jimmy'z Masonry Crystal Lake, IL | $1,716,000.00 | $70,600.00 y y y y y
Mastership Construction Co. Libertyville, IL $1,310,000.00 | $54,400.00
Pyzik Masonry Schaumburg, IL |no bid
Low Bid $1,310,000.00 | $54,400.00
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Structural Steel 05A-1

Elgin Community College Health Career Center for Excellence
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Third Floor | Recycled /LS E L/
Trade Contractor Location Base Bid Shell Content \?§ XSS SR E Combination Bid Notes
Art Iron, Inc. Toledo, OH $2,789,000.00 | $147,000.00 $0.00 y |y ylyl|ly
Carlo Steel, Inc. Chicago, IL $2,859,750.00 | $193,213.00 |avail later 3 y yly|ly
Cives Steel, Inc. Wolcott, IN $2,275,000.00 | $121,000.00 $0.00 y |y ylyl|y
Construction Systems, Inc. Staples, MN no bid
Lejeune Steel Company Indianapolis, IN| $2,281,300.00 | $135,700.00 $0.00 y |y ylyl|y
Lennex Steel Company Indianapolis, IN| $2,398,103.00 | $140,969.00 $0.00 y ylyl|y
Midwestern Steel Sales Bensenville, IL | $2,740,000.00 | $185,000.00 $0.00 y |y ylyl|y
S. G. Krauss Company Elk Grove Village, IL | $2,190,000.00 | $97,500.00 $0.00 y |y y|ly|ly $2,387,500.00 [05a and 05b
T. A. Bowman Constructors Bloomingdale, IL [no bid
Hammerts Iron Works St. Louis, MO | $2,145,000.00 | $142,000.00 $0.00 y |y y|ly|y
Low Bid $2,145,000.00 | $142,000.00 $0.00




Elgin Community College Health Career Center for Excellence

Building and Landscape Package
Friday, February 12, 2010

11:00 AM

General Trades 06A-1
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Trade Contractor Location Base Bid Shell vb LSS L Combination Bid Notes
Boller Construction Waukegan, IL $1,521,000.00 $0.00 y y y y y
Doherty Construction Woodstock, IL $988,700.00 $1,700.00 y y y y y $1,476,000.00 |06a and 08a
Edwin Anderson Construction Schiller Park, IL [no bid
Frontier Construction Orland Park, IL | $1,075,000.00 $0.00 y y y y y
Hargrave Builders South Elgin, IL $865,000.00 $2,500.00 y y y y y $1,275,000.00 |06a and 08a
J. C. Harris & Sons, Inc. Elgin, IL $981,000.00 | $17,000.00 y y y y y $2,430,000.00 |06a, 06b, and 08a
L.J. Morse Aurora, IL $1,024,900.00 $3,300.00 y y y y %
Manusos General Contractors Fox Lake, IL $1,106,000.00 | $22,141.00 y y y y y
Northwest Contractors, Inc. Hampshire, IL $1,375,000.00 | $24,000.00 y y y y y
Stuckey Construcation Company Waukegan, IL $1,014,000.00 $1,000.00 y y y y y
Wm. Tonyan & Sons, Inc. McHenry, IL withdrawn
RL Sohol Plainfield, IL $1,072,500.00 | $1,500.00 || vy | vy ylyly
Low Bid $865,000.00 $2,500.00
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Millwork/Casework 06B-1

Elgin Community College Health Career Center for Excellence
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Trade Contractor Location Base Bid v/ (AN Q O Combination Bid Notes
Accurate Custom Cabinets Addison, IL no bid
Boller Construction Waukegan, IL | $1,067,000.00 y y y y y
J. C. Harris & Sons, Inc. Elgin, IL $1,020,500.00 y y y y y
Lowery McDonnell Wooddale, IL  [Withdrawn
Phoenix Woodworking, Inc. Woodstock, IL [Withdrawn
Rieke Office Interiors, Inc. Elgin, IL Withdrawn
Wampach Woodwork, Inc. South Elgin, IL [no bid
Carroll Seating Elk Gr, IL $833,000.00 y y y y y
Larson Equipment Palatine, IL $968,197.00 y y y y y
Low Bid $833,000.00
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Roofing 07A-1
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Trade Contractor Location Base Bid Shell Roof vb EVASYEOVEIES Combination Bid Notes
Anthony Roofing Inc. Aurora, IL $552,423.00 | ($39,000.00)| $193,675.00 y y y y y
A-1 Roofing Elk Grove Village, IL $519,947.00 | ($17,924.00)| $103,169.00 y y y y y
Bennett & Brosseau Roofing Inc. Romeoville, IL $608,200.00 | ($60,000.00)| $115,900.00 y y y y y
Crowther Roofing & Sheet Metal, Inc. Lockport, IL $523,700.00 | ($50,000.00)| $200,000.00 y y y y y
E. W. Olson Roofing, Inc. West Chicago, IL $602,860.00 | ($47,380.00)| $147,880.00 y y y y y
Metalmaster Roofmaster McHenry, IL $423,920.00 | ($37,000.00)| $121,670.00 y y y y
Nations Roof North Waukesha, WE no bid
Olsson Roofing Company, Inc. Aurora, IL $462,616.00 | ($19,236.00)| $110,243.00 y y y y y
Riddiford Roofing Arlington Heights, IL $582,000.00 | ($34,000.00)| $138,000.00 y y y y y
Sullivan Roofing, Inc. Schaumburg, IL $410,800.00 | ($29,700.00)| $138,000.00 y y y y y
Weatherguard Roofing Co. Elgin, Il $445,000.00 | ($45,000.00)| $128,000.00 y y y y y
All American Lake Zurich, iL $540,825.00 | ($43,000.00)| $157,835.00 y y y y y
Low Bid $410,800.00 | ($29,700.00)| $138,000.00
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Exterior Wall Panels 07B-1
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Trade Contractor Location Base Bid Shell vb LIV EES Combination Bid Notes
All American Exterior Solutions Lake Zurich, IL $690,000.00 | $26,200.00 y y y y y
Architectural Panel Systems Naperville, IL No Bid
Boswell Building Contractors, Inc Wood Dale, IL $1,013,761.00 $0.00 y y y y y
Crown Corr, Inc. Highland, IN $863,000.00 | $51,000.00 y y y y y
G & L Associates, Inc. Des Plaines, IL  |No Bid
Nations Roof North Waukesha, WI $585,750.00 | $12,550.00 y y y y y
S. G. Krauss Company Elk Grove Village, IL |No Bid
Tuschall Engineering Co., Inc. Burr Ridge, IL $835,000.00 | $18,000.00 y y y y y
Riddiford Arl Hts, IL $582,600.00 | ($90,000.00)|| vy y y y y
Low Bid $582,600.00 | $12,550.00
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Hollow Metal Doors, Frames, and Hardware 08A-1
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Trade Contractor Location Base Bid Shell vb LSS L Combination Bid Notes
Boller Construction Waukegan, IL $558,000.00 $6,400.00 y y y y y
Doherty Construction Woodstock, IL $509,900.00 $2,900.00 y y y y y |yes
Edwin Anderson Schiller Park, IL $507,000.00 $3,490.00 y y y y %
Hargrave Builders, Inc. South Elgin, IL $415,400.00 $2,500.00 y y y y y $1,275,000.00 |06a and 08a
J. C. Harris & Sons, Inc. Elgin, IL $443,000.00 $2,645.00 y y y y %
L.J. Morse Co. Aurora, IL $475,800.00 $5,400.00 y y y y y
Manusos Fox Lake, IL $523,000.00 $6,565.00 y y y y %
RB Construction Villa Park, IL $472,970.00 $3,300.00 y y y y y
Stuckey Constructin Co., Inc. Waukegan, IL $479,000.00 $3,700.00 y y y y %
RL Sohol Plainfield, IL $660,000.00 [ $3,150.00 || y | y vIyly
Low Bid $415,400.00 $2,500.00
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Aluminum, Glass, and Glazing 08B-1
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Trade Contractor Location Base Bid Shell vb LAV & Combination Bid Notes
Alliance Glass & Metal, Inc. Romeoville, IL $3,251,130.00 | $127,770.00 y y y y y
Chicago Heights Glass, Inc. South Holland, IL  |Withdrawn
CK2 Contracting Elmhurst, IL no bid
East Moline Glass Co. East Moline, IL $2,733,000.00 | $118,330.00 y y y y y
Frontrunner Systems, IL Bolingbrook, IL $2,439,600.00 | $102,500.00 y y y y y
Lake Shore Glass & Mirror Co. Chicago, IL $2,270,769.00 | $105,000.00 y y y y y
McHenry County Glass & Mirror McHenry, IL $2,286,000.00 | $96,000.00 y y y y y
Rock Valley Glass, Inc. Cherry Valley, IL $2,038,000.00 | $79,500.00 y y y y y
Triumph Restoration, Inc. Mokena, IL no bid
Low Bid $2,038,000.00 | $79,500.00
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Metal Studs and Drywall 09A-1
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Third Floor | Resistant /LS E L/
Trade Contractor Location Base Bid Shell Drywall YLV ETES Combination Bid Notes

Doherty Construction Woodstock, IL | $2,128,900.00 | $88,000.00 | $20,400.00 y |y ylyly $3,542,000.00 [06a, 08a and 09a
International Decorators Wauconda, IL $1,951,012.00 | $90,770.00 | $14,495.00 y |y y|lyl|ly
L.J. Morse Construction Co. Aurora, IL $1,999,695.00 | $48,325.00 $6,200.00 y |y y|lyl|y
Levy Company Northbrook, IL | $2,136,125.00 | $188,500.00 | $12,900.00 y |y y|lyl|ly
Peak Carpentry Algonquin, IL $1,764,337.00 | $103,300.00 | $19,767.00 y |y ylyl|y
Pepper Construction Barrington, IL | $2,775,000.00 | $115,000.00 | $14,000.00 y ylyl|y
Drywall Service Shiller pk, IL $1,850,073.00 | $42,800.00 | $59,495.00 y |y ylyl|y
Midwest accoustics Romeoville, IL | $1,745,985.00 | $120,605.00 | $12,915.00 y |y ylyly $2,111,470.00 [09a and 09d
Low Bid $1,745,985.00 | $120,605.00 | $12,915.00
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Terrazzo Flooring 09C-1
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Menconi Terrazzo & Tile Co. Bensenville, IL no bid
Metropolitan Terrazzo, LLC Elk Grove Village, IL| $994,000.00 y y y y y
Rockford Central Tile & Terrazzo Rockford, IL $982,260.00 y y y y y
Terrazzo & Marble Wheeling, IL no bid
The Krez Group Bensenville, IL $907,500.00 y y y y y
Northern IL Terrazzo Rockford, IL $908,800.00 y y y y
Low Bid $907,500.00
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Acoustic Ceiling 09D-1
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Trade Contractor Location Base Bid Shell vb L ILOVEES Combination Bid Notes
Airtite Contractors, Inc. Elmhurst, IL $379,800.00 $1,800.00 4 y y y y
International Decorators, Inc. Wauconda, IL $377,350.00 $975.00 y y y y y
Just Rite Acoustics, Inc. Elk Grove Village, IL $373,800.00 $900.00 y y y y y
L. J. Morse Aurora, IL $564,785.00 $1,430.00 y y y y y
Midwest Acoustics Romeoville, IL $386,814.00 $940.00 y y y % y
Sullivan Brothers, Inc. Madison, Wi $398,845.00 $900.00 y y y y y
Low Bid $373,800.00 $900.00
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Carpet and Resilient Flooring 09F-1
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Douglas Carpet One Aurora, IL $658,400.00 $4,400.00 y y y y y

Libertyville Tile & Carpet Libertyville, IL $667,975.00 $5,550.00 y y y y y

OEC Business Ineteriors Elmhurst, IL $616,356.41 $3,100.00 y y y y %

Rieke Office Interiors Elgin, IL $679,950.00 $4,500.00 y y y y y

Rockford Carpetland USA Rockford, IL $569,259.00 $0.00 4 |y y y y

\Vortex Enterprises, Inc. Addison, IL $784,765.00 $5,560.00 y y y y y

Low Bid $569,259.00 $0.00
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Painting 09G-1
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Trade Contractor Location Base Bid Shell Y/ XSS Combination Bid Notes
All-Tech Decorating, Inc. Romeoville, IL $192,000.00 $1,250.00 y y y y
Bill's Painting Co. Des Plaines, IL $157,000.00 $2,800.00 y y y y
D.E.S. Painting, Inc. Chicago, IL no bid
Drywall Service Schiller Park, IL  [no bid
Lankford Construction Co. Johnsburg, IL $200,740.00 $8,900.00 y y y y y
Midwest Decorating, Inc. Hampshire, IL $277,517.00 $9,100.00 y y y y y
Oosterbaan & Sons Co. Posen, IL $241,125.00 $0.00 y y y y y
Ruffalo Painting Co. Kenosha, IL $265,890.00 $2,317.00 y y y y y
Triangle Decorating Co. LLC Schaumburg, IL $219,965.00 | $22,660.00 4 y y y y
Low Bid $157,000.00 $2,800.00




Elgin Community College Health Career Center for Excellence

Building and Landscape Package

Friday, February 12, 2010
1:00 PM

Science Casework 12A-1
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Trade Contractor Location Base Bid NV LY E VRIS Combination Bid Notes

Carroll Seating Company Elk Grove Village, IL |no bid

Harry J. Kloeppel & Associates, Inc. Wheeling, IL $910,368.00 y y y y y
Kewaunee Scentific Corporation Glen Ellyn, IL no bid

Larson Equipment Co. Palatine, IL no bid

Scott Laboratory Solutions Knoxville, TN $745,000.00 y y y y y
Boller Construction Co Waukegan, IL $784,000.00 y y y y

Low Bid

$745,000.00
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Plumbing 15A-1
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Third Floor Y /&
Trade Contractor Location Base Bid Shell \?p CAALVEIES Combination Bid Notes
Action Plumbing West Chicago, IL | $1,566,420.00 [ $11,000.00 y y y y y
Capitol Mechanical Industries Lombard, IL $1,454,500.00 $9,500.00 y y y y y
C. R. Leonard Plumbing Joliet, IL $1,474,919.00 $5,000.00 y y y y y
De Franco Plumbing, Inc. Palatine, IL $1,598,749.00 $3,500.00 4 y y y y
F.J.Bero & Co., Inc. Elgin, IL no bid
Hartwig Plumbing & heating, Inc. Harvard, IL $1,305,000.00 | $58,195.00 y y y y y
Jensen's Plumbing & Heating, Inc. |Woodstock, IL $1,267,400.00 $6,700.00 y y y y y
Mechanical Inc. Freeport, IL $1,479,000.00 | $10,800.00 y y y y y $5,898,000.00 |15a and 15c¢
MG Mechanical, Inc. Woodstock, IL $1,211,600.00 | $24,000.00 y y y y y
Miller Engineering Co. Rockford, IL no bid
T.P. Adamson & Associates Chicago, IL $1,429,999.00 $1,645.00 y y y y y
TMS Mechanical McHenry, IL no bid
Low Bid $1,211,600.00 | $24,000.00
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Fire Protection 15B-1

Alternate #1

Third Floor
Trade Contractor Location Base Bid Shell Notes

Alliance Vernon Hill, IL $323,790.00 | $16,500.00
Automatic fire systems Rockford, IL $355,383.00 [ $14,803.00
Absolute Rockford, IL $315,000.00 $3,000.00
Nelson Fire Rockford, IL $299,844.00 | $18,473.00
Optimal Fire Aurora, IL $238,000.00 | $20,000.00
Valley Fire Batavia, IL $264,600.00 $9,800.00
Wolverine Fire Arl Hts, IL $359,400.00 | $14,000.00
Low Bid $238,000.00 | $20,000.00
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HVAC - 15C-1
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Trade Contractor Location Base Bid Shell vb XSS E Combination Bid Notes

C. Acitelli Heating & Piping Villa Park, IL $4,198,000.00 | $42,000.00 y y y y y

Amber Mechanical Alsip, IL $4,639,000.00 | $46,000.00 y y y y y

Climatemp, Inc. Chicago, IL $4,560,000.00 [ $50,000.00 y y y y y

Commercial Mechanical, Inc. Dunlap, IL $4,678,000.00 | $47,000.00 y y y y y

Elgin Sheet Metal South Elgin, IL no bid y y y y y

Flo-Tech Mechanical Systems Addison, IL $4,348,000.00 | $50,000.00 y y y y y

International Piping Systems, Inc. |Schaumburg, IL | $4,540,000.00 | $40,400.00 y y y y y $4,825,000.00 |15c and 15d
Mechanical Inc. Freeport, IL $4,469,000.00 | $58,000.00 y y y y y $5,898,000.00 [15a and 15¢c
MG Mechanical, Inc. Woodstock, IL $3,798,000.00 | $49,300.00 y y y y y $4,966,000.00 [15a and 15¢c
Monaco Mechanical Westmont, IL $5,574,000.00 | $18,000.00 y y y y y

National heat and power Skokie, IL $4,189,000.00 | $12,000.00 y y y y y

Quality Control Systems Matteson, IL no bid y y y y y

Premier Addison, IL $4,256,000.00 | $42,000.00

Low Bid $3,798,000.00 | $49,300.00
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Medical Gas Piping 15D -1
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Trade Contractor Location Base Bid v/ o’/ Q N Combination Bid Notes

BeaconMedaes Overland Park, KS|no bid
Mechanical Inc. Freeport, IL $254,000.00 y y y y y
Monaco Mechanical Westmont, IL $638,000.00 y y y y y
Commercial Mechanical Dunlap, L $270,000.00 y y y y y
International Piping Schaumburg, IL | $305,000.00 || v | VY y|ly|y $4,825,000.00 |15c¢ and 15d
Premier Mechanical Addison, IL $245,000.00 y y y y

Low Bid

$245,000.00
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Electrical 16A-1

X
Alternate #3 hel (\e& .&\s‘\\& \g}@
Alternate #1 Extend b@\' .Q,éo &\(’@ oé‘ QOQ:
Third Floor | Distribution /LS E L/
Trade Contractor Location Base Bid Shell Loop SV LIOVETES Combination Bid Notes
Associated Electrical Contractors [Woodstock, IL | $2,908,000.00 | $16,100.00 | $151,400.00 y |y ylyl|y
Carey Electric Contracting McHenry, IL $2,964,000.00 | $30,000.00 | $138,710.00 y |y ylyl|y
Connelly Electric Addison, IL $4,587,000.00 | $28,000.00 | $184,000.00 y |y ylyl|y
Excel Electric Inc. Frankfort, IL | $3,196,167.00 | $66,999.00 | $172,716.00 y |y ylyl|y
Fitzgerald Electric Bid Rock, IL $3,184,000.00 | $23,700.00 | $185,462.00 y |y ylyl|y
Gibson Downers Gr, [no bid y y y y
Kellenberger Elgin, IL $2,635,000.00 | $19,160.00 | $188,000.00 y |y y|ly|y
Mascal Dekalb, IL $3,381,500.00 | $31,000.00 | $139,000.00 y |y ylyl|y
Preferred Electric Roselle, IL $2,915,000.00 | $13,000.00 | $267,000.00 y |y y|lyl|ly $3,030,000.00 [16a and 16d
Low Bid $2,635,000.00 | $19,160.00 | $188,000.00
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Network Cabling 16B-1
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Trade Contractor Location Base Bid Shell vb LSS \06 & Combination Bid Notes

Advanced Wiring Solutions Alsip, IL $220,445.00 $250.00 y y y y y

Applied Communications Group Roselle, IL $184,542.25 |n/a y y y y y

Chicagoland Cabling Solutions, Inc. |Lombard, IL $242,276.00 $225.00 y y y y y

Facility Technologies LLC Algonquin, IL No bid

Gibson Electric & Technology Downers Grove $240,000.00 $225.00 3 y y y y

Huen Electric Broadview, IL No bid

Northern lllinois Telecom Rolling Meadows, IL | $190,175.00 $0.00 y y y y y

TelePlus, Inc. Addison, Il $177,200.00 |n/a y y y y y

Kelso Burnett Rockford, IL $323,450.00 $235.00 y y y y y

Low Voltage Sol Crest Hill, IL $191,230.00 $0.00 y y y y y

Midco Burr Ridge, IL $275,449.00 $0.00 y y y y y

Low Bid $177,200.00 $0.00
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Building Automation System 17A-1
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Third Floor | Solutions Trane ) S /& L S/
Trade Contractor Location Base Bid Shell Tie-In Tie-In vé LSS LS \ﬂ‘e Combination Bid Notes
Automated Logic Chicago, IL $643,333.00 $17,274.00 | $16,960.00 [ $31,210.00 y y y y y
The Trane Company, Inc. Willowbrook, IL $689,000.00 $0.00 $48,125.00 y y y y y

Low Bid

$643,333.00 $17,274.00 [ $16,960.00 | $31,210.00






