Northern lllinois Special Recreation Association

10 A.M. Thursday, May 14, 2009

General Trades 06A
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Alternate No. 8 \'b G‘& o &(\
f{emove. Alterna.te No.9 (\b 3 i‘&. 000
. Alternate No. 2 | Alternate No.3 Alternat_e No. 4 | flooring/cabinets| Work in NW bbe o°b 0&( (38 o\\ L :
Trade Contractor Base Bid New Casework [ Concrete Ramp | New Patio Door | NE Quadrant Quadrant YR Combination Bid Notes
|Boller Construction $ 252,000.00 | $ 15,500.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 15,000.00 [ $ 14,500.00 | $  86,500.00 y y
[carmichael Construction No Bid
IDoherty Construction $ 208,900.00 [ $ 11,500.00 | $ 2,300.00 | $ 4,900.00 | $ 4,200.00 | $ 55,000.00 y yl|y
|Hargrave Builders $ 185,000.00 | $ 9,500.00 | $ 2,800.00 | $ 4,800.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 46,000.00 y yly
J.C. Harris & Sons Withdrawn
Wm. Tonyan $ 199,000.00 | $ 11,200.00 | $ 2,100.00 | $ 4,250.00 | $ 6,500.00 | $ 76,000.00 y y
JLow Bid $ 185,000.00 | $ 9,500.00 | $ 2,800.00 | $ 4,800.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 46,000.00




Northern lllinois Special Recreation Association

Administration Building Renovations
10 A.M. Thursday, May 14, 2009

Drywall 09A
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Alternate 9 Drywall, 2 EAS (3
Alternate 5 Optima | Stud, & Acoustical | Alternate 9a Upgrade bé‘ (\6 (&\ .\8 .(§\°
Trade Contractor Base Bid Acoustic Tile Tile Acoustical Tile v'b Y Y Combination Bid Notes

Doherty Construction $ 46,600.00 | $ 14,800.00 | $ 13,000.00 | $ 14,300.00 || y |y yly
Drywall Services, Inc. No Bid
Heitkotter, Inc. $ 54238.00 $ 14,498.00 | $ 14,920.00 | $ 4,506.00 || vy |y yly
International Decorators, Inc. $ 52,786.00 | $ 16,000.00 | $ 8,569.00 | $ 2,350.00 || vy | v yly
The Levy Corporation $ 52,315.00 | $ - $ 10,250.00 | $ 12,250.00 ||y |y yly
Shanahan Drywall $ 43,495.00 | $ - |$ 697000 $ 1,584.00 |y |y | |y|y
Low Bid $ 43,495.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 6,970.00 | $ 1,584.00




Northern lllinois Special Recreation Association

Administration Building Renovations

10 A.M. Thursday, May 14, 2009

Flooring 09F
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Alternate No. 6 Alternate No. 8 | Alternate No. 9 P > {\o“’ (3
Armstrong Wood | Luan & Carpet in | New Flooring in O {é‘ S
Trade Contractor Base Bid Look Alternate 8 space | Alernate 9 space Y Y Combination Bid Notes
Coleman Floor Company No Bid
Douglas Carpet One $ 89,000.00 | $ 1,040.00 | $ 12,772.00 [ $  33,926.00 y y|y
Libertyville Tile & Carpet $ 84,825.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 12,030.00 | $ 22,996.00 y y
Midwest Floor Covering, Inc. No Bid
OEC Business Interiors $ 76,378.87 | $ 7,716.13 | $ - $ 31,272.64 y
Rockford Carpetland USA, Inc. $ 62,300.00 | $ - $ 8,900.00 | $ 19,000.00 y y
Vortex Flooring
Low Bid $ 62,300.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 8,900.00 | $ 19,000.00




Northern lllinois Special Recreation Association

Administration Building Renovations

10 A.M. Thursday, May 14, 2009

Painting 09G
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Alternate No. 9 . 7 0.00""‘; &(\‘?
Alternate No. 1 Wall|  Alternate No. 8 Pain & Wall ng & (\oq' (<7
Covering in Private | Paint in Alternate 8 Covering in ) {&‘ .\\,Q .o&\o
Trade Contractor Base Bid Offices spaces Alternate 9 spaces LA BEY, Combination Bid Notes
All-Tech Decorating $ 50,100.00 | $ 13,500.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 8,000.00 y yly
|Brookdale Decorating, Inc. $ 76,500.00 | $ 44,500.00 | $ 4,500.00 | $ 13,500.00 y y|y
|p.E.s. Painting, Inc. No Bid
IDrywaII Service Inc. $ 34,500.00 | $ 14,500.00 | $ 8,750.00 | $ 12,360.00 y yly
|Internationa| Decorators, Inc. No Bid
IJ&M Decorating $ 44,782.00 | $ 15,019.00 | $ 6,215.00 | $ 7,469.00 y yly
IMidwest Decorating $ 41,455.00 | $ 16,325.00 | $ 5,200.00 | $ 7,660.00 y yly
|Oosterbaan & Sons Co. $ 49,730.00 | $ 7,300.00 | $ 5,700.00 | $ 8,700.00 y yly
IProfessional Decorating $ 54,000.00 | $ 21,825.00 | $ 4,992.70 | $ 9,734.80 y yly
Soutsos Decorating Company $ 58,900.00 | $ 14,950.00 | $ 4,400.00 | $ 8,200.00 y yly
JLow Bid $ 34,500.00 | $ 14,500.00 | $ 8,750.00 | $ 12,360.00




Administration Building Renovations

10 A.M. Thursday, May 14, 2009

Mechanical 15A

Northern lllinois Special Recreation Association
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Alternate No. 8 Alternate No. 9 N bdt & c,é\
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. Work in Alternate 8 | Work in Alternate 9 £ ob S -
Trade Contractor Base Bid space space % O/ R Combination Bid Notes
Acitelli Heating & Piping $ 88,000.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 47,000.00 || v | v yly
Action Mechanical $ 69,370.00 | $ 3,690.00 | $ 48,175.00 || v | v yly
Althoff Industries, Inc. $ 81,800.00 | $ 800.00 | $ 23,000.00 [| v | v yly $196,280.00 |W/16A
/Amber Mechanical Contractors, inc. $ 108,000.00 | $ 3,298.00 | $ 17,968.00 || vy | v yly Add 1&2 only
JH.R. Stewart, Inc. No Bid
|Hartwig Plumbing & Heating, Inc. No Bid
Jensen's Plumbing & Heating, Inc. $ 99,560.00 | $ 1,550.00 | $ 19,700.00 || vy | y yly
Joe Bero Plumbing No Bid
IMG Mechanical $ 79,000.00 | $ 6,800.00 | $ 15,330.00 || y | vy yly
IMmiller Engineering Company $ 54,700.00 | $ - $ 11,500.00 || y ylyly
Sherman Mechanical, Inc. $ 78,258.00 | $ 2,875.00 | $ 17,800.00 || v | y yly
Westside Mechanical, Inc. No Bid
JLow Bid $ 54,700.00 | $ - $ 11,500.00




Northern lllinois Special Recreation Association

Administration Building Renovations
10 A.M. Thursday, May 14, 2009

Electrical 16A
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Alternate No. 7 Alternate No. 9 ng &) {\oe‘ (<7
Luna Lights in lieu | Work in Alternate 9 & (\b {&‘ .{8 .oi\°
Trade Contractor Base Bid of Parabolic space vb ALY, Combination Bid Notes
Althoff Industries, Inc. $ 121,500.00 | $ 12,400.00 | $ 40,000.00 [| v | v yly $196,280.00 |w/ 15A
Associated Electrical Contractors, Inc. $ 98,920.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 23,980.00 (| v | v yly
Benson Electrical Contracting, Inc. $ 110,775.00 | $ 6,800.00 | $ 25,700.00 || v | v yly
Carey Electric Contracting, Inc. $ 108,950.00 | $ 4,850.00 | $ 37,740.00 | v | v yly
Kellenberger Electric $ 105,000.00 | $ 5,200.00 | $ 33,000.00 || vy | v y |y
KIl Electrical Contractors No Bid
Ridgeview Electric $ 97,000.00 | $ 5,300.00 | $ 32,000.00 || y | v yly
Low Bid $ 97,000.00 | $ 5,300.00 | $ 32,000.00




