Community Unit School District 300

Dundee-Crown High School Stormwater Management

11 A.M. Wednesday, June 2, 2010

Excavation & Site Utilities - 02B
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Trade Contractor Base Bid Spoils onsite Y V'R Notes

Bell Land Improvement No Bid

Berger Excavating Contractors $ 78,000.00 | $ (15,000.00)|| X | X X | X
Campton Excavating, Inc. No Bid

Copenhaver $ 62,800.00 | $ (8,000.00){| X | X X | X

Curran Contracting Company $ 98,015.00 | $ (8,436.00)|| X | X X | X

DiMeo Brother's, Inc. No Bid

DuPage Topsoil Inc. $ 71,200.00 | $ (12,200.00)| X | X X | X

Earth Werks Land Improvements Withdrawn

Fiordirosa Construction Company| $ 62,500.00 | $ (12,700.00)|| X | X X | X

Fox Excavating, Inc. $ 57,950.00 | $ (5,000.00)|| X [ X X | X

J. S. Riemer, Inc. $ 64,000.00 | $ (3,000.00)(| X [ X X | X

Lake County Grading Co. No Bid

Maneval Construction No Bid

Read Excavating $ 56,745.00 | $ (6,687.50)|| X | X X | X
Schneider Excavating $ 122,000.00 | $ (50,000.00)|| X [ X X | X

Vegter Excavating, Inc. No Bid

Low Bid $ 56,745.00




