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Building and Landscape Package

Monday, March 29, 2010
11:00 AM

Ornamental Steel (Stairs, Ladders, and Rails) 05B-2
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Combination Bid Notes
Chicago Architectural Metals, Inc. Chicago No bid
Hammerts Iron Works, Inc. St. Louis, MO $250,000.00 $15,000.00 y y y y y
K & K Iron Works, Inc. McCook No bid
S. G. Krauss Company Elk Grove Village $227,000.00 $13,000.00 y y y y y $1,061,000.00 05b and 05c
Structural Strategies Addison $267,000.00 $16,500.00 y y y y y
T. A. Bowman Constructors Bloomingdale $195,900.00 $11,800.00 y y y y y
Wm Horn Geneva $258,540.00 $0.00 y y y y y

$195,900.00 $16,500.00
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Glazed Decorative Metal Railings 05C-2
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Combination Bid Notes
Bianco Glass Northbrook No bid
Chicago Architectural Metals Chicago No bid
Fenestration Incorporated Carpentersville No bid
Hammerts Iron Works, Inc. St. Louis, MO No bid
HDI Railing Systems Columbia, PA No bid
Radyeo Enterprises, Inc. Ball Ground, GA No bid
S. G. Krauss Company Elk Grove Village $839,000.00 y y y y y yes 05b and 05c
T. A. Bowman Constructors Bloomingdale $726,500.00 y y y y y
Rock Valley Glass Rockford $497,000.00 y y y y y

Low Bid $497,000.00
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Lockers 10A-2
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Combination Bid Notes
Carroll Seating Company Elk Grove Village $50,782.00 y y y y y
Dearborn Midwest Corporation Wheaton $67,622.00 y y y y y
Larson Equipment Palatine $59,075.00 y y y y y
Lyon Workspace Products LLC Montgomery $45,166.87 y y y y y
Prestige Distribution Northbrook No Bid
Storologie LLC Wheaton No Bid

Low Bid $45,166.87
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Elevators 14A-2
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Combination Bid Notes
Colley Elevator Company Bensonville $387,985.00 y y y y y
Mitsubishi Elevators Countryside withdrawn
Otis Elevator Company Lombard $271,000.00 y y y y y
Schindler Elevator Corporation Elmhurst $243,300.00 y y y y y
ThyssenKrupp Elevator Corp. Westchester $229,500.00 y y y y y

Low Bid $229,500.00



Security System 16C-2
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Combination Bid Notes
Acamard Technologies, Inc. Schaumburg No bid
Applied Communications Group Roselle $37,069.00 $0.00 y y y y y
Convergint Technologies, LLC Schaumburg Withdrawn
Malko Technologies Morton Grove No bid
Midco, Inc. Burr Ridge $39,785.00 included y y y y y
Simplex Grinnell Addison No bid
Video and Sound Service, Inc. Northlake Bid not read n addenda not noted

Low Bid $37,069.00 $0.00
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Fire Alarm 16D-2
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Combination Bid Notes
Associated Electrical Contractors Woodstock $110,289.00 $1,865.00 y y y y y
Kellenberger Electric Elgin $108,000.00 $2,400.00 y y y y y
KII Electrical Contractors Woodstock Withdrawn
Malko Technical Services Morton Grove No bid
Video and Sound Service, Inc. Northlake No bid

Low Bid $108,000.00 $2,400.00
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